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GERMANY: On July 2nd, ln the forefield of his appeal
proceedings, the many-year activist Manfred Roeder, 73,

was arrested because the judge issued an arrest warrant.
During his appeal proceedings, he was in handcuffs. The
Superior Court of Rostock (German state: Mechienburg-
Vorpommern) sentenced Comrade Manfred Roeder to 21

months in jail for revilement of the Federal Republic of
Germany, hate speech and an offense (calling the gov-

ernment an asshole, dirty pig etc.). His appeal proceedings

brought him only 3 months less. The treatment of Comrade
Roeder was unfair and scandalous. (Note: lt is not known
which offense he did. lt may have been an offense against
the Jews or the government.)

On July Sth, the former SS Major Friedrich Engel. 93, has
been found guilty of the murder of 59 ltalian prisonerc dur-
ing VvlA/ll. He pleaded not guil$ to charges of murder
and was spared a 7-year jail term because of hia age.
(Note: The reason for the executions was a bomb attempt
on a cinema full of German soldiers by ltalian communists.
All allies have done the same things in \lv1Nll.)

On July 6th, Christian Worch, the leader of the so-called
Free Fellowships, organized a protest rally against left'
wing violence with approximately 250 nationalists (most of
them skinheads) in the inner City of Magdelburg (German
state: Saxony-Anhalt). The reason for the protest rally
was attacks on nationalists and arsons, and attacks on
nationalist property through lefi-wing tenorists. The left-
wing scum held their own gathering near the central sta-
tion of Magdelburg with approximately 50 Reds. Both ral-
lies were peaceful.

On the same day, in the City of Dortmund (German
state: Northrhine-Westfalia) in a tram, six nationalists
made first offenses to an ape couple (niggers) and later

they were punched in their faces several times. The ape
couple were injured but they could find a way to escape
with help of a citizen. The six young nationalists, ages
between 16 and 19 years, were arrested.

On July 11th, the Federal Minister of the lnterior, Mr.

Schily, and all other Ministers of the lnterior in the
German states would not give out information about the
names of agents to the Federal Constitutional Court in

Karlsruhe (German state: Baden-Wuerttemberg) in the
trial to ban the NPD. The dirty system will try to start the
trial in October. (Our correspondent does not believe that
the NPD has a real chance to win after this agreement
between the Ministers of the lnterior.)

On July 16th, the Federal Ministry ofthe lnteriorsearched
40 homes of alleged members of the skinhead organization
Hammerskins in seven German states and confiscated
CDs, propaganda material and lists of names. The
Hamn:ersl<ins organization is in Germany and not legal
and the system describes the organization as a criminal
association.

On July 27th, there was a protest rally against the collabo-
ration between system and anti-fascists with 60 nationalists
in the City of Dresden (German state: Saxony). Some
nationalists held in their hands political banners. The
protest rally was organized through a free fellowship with
the name "Free Forces of Saxony." Several hundred coun-
terdemonstrators were there. The mayor of Dresden
marched with the Red counterdemonstrators and gave a
speech to the Red scum. No arrests were made by the
system cops or federal border troops. Both rallies were
peaceful.

On July 28th and 29th, during the night to Monday, six
Red bastards made an assault on the NPD local branch
leader of Stralsund (German state: Mecklenburg-



Vorpommern), Dirk Arendt. The bastards knocked down
and injured him. Each Red bastard a bullet in the head!

On August 17th, there was a rally to honour the prisoner of
peace, Rudolf Hess, in the small town of Wunsiedel
(German state: Bavaria). ln this small town of his bur-
ial place since 1987, between 2,600 and 3,000 national-
ists marched .powerfully and peacefully through the small
town. tJnder the marchers were guests from Denmark,

Sweden, France, Austria, Switzerland, Spain,
Netherlands, Finland and Estonia. Some foreign guests

read messages in their language to the marchers. The
organizers of this rally was lawyer Juergen Rieger from
Hamburg and the vice chairman of the NPD, Holger Apfel.
There were speeches by Rieger, Apfel, Wolfgang Juchen
and Thomas Wulff. About 100 Red counterdemonstra-
tors were there. No chance for the Red scum because
they had trouble with the town folk. The town folk agree with
the nationalist cause to honour Rudolf Hess. The sy$em
puppets checked all the nationalists and proofed their
identity cards in the forefield of this rally for 6 hours.

Only 25 nationalists were anested because the system
slaves found knives, truncheons and gas pistols. These
things are illegal at rallies in Germany. Our correspondent
has heard that four Red trouble-makers were anested too.

The nationalists will come back next year to honor Rudolf
Hess again.

On September 7th, there was an open air election cam-
paign meeting with approximately 130 NPD supporters
near the railway station of \A/uppertal (German state:
Northrhine-Westfalia). The campaigner gave a speech
about the risks of immigration for Germany. Some NPD
party members held during his speech NPD party flags in

their hands and built up an information table with free NPD
propaganda material. Nearly 1,500 communists and sev-
eral hundred cops were there. There was no violence or
anests.

On the same day, unknown nationalists smashed 10 grave-

stones with a round set hammer on a Jewish cemetery
in the smalltown of BueEow (German state: Mecklenburg-
Vorpommern). Swastikas and SS runes were painted on

other gravestones.

On September 14th, there was an NPD protest rally
with approximately 75 comrades in the City of Potsdam
(German state: Brandenburg). "Stop the mass immigration
of Russian Jews-Germany for Germans" was the
rally slogan. One thousand counterdemonstrators were
there. Jews out!

September 22nd was election day for the Lower House of
the German Federal Parliament. There were poor results
for the German right-wing parties Republicans (REP) and
National democratic Party of Germany (NPD). The
Republicans gained only 0.6% of the votes nationwide and
the NPD gained 0.4% of the votes. lt is sad that the
German people always vote for the rotten and corrupt sys-

'tem parties under the hidden rule of the dirty Jews. The

final solution is the only solution!

On the same day, there were elections for the State
Parliament House of the German state of Mecklenburg-
Vorpommern too. There were not much better results for
the right-wing parties regarding the Federal elections. The
NPD and Republicans (REP) did run for Parliament seats.
The results are 0.8% of the votes for the NPD and 0.3% for
the REP.

FRANCE: On July 14th, the French nationalist Maxime
Brunerie, 25, fired a single shot from a 0.Z2-caliber rifle as
French President Chirac passed by the Arc de Triumphe
in the capital city of Paris on Sunday but some citizens
overpowered Nationalist Brunerie, lt is a legal holiday to
celebrate the Jewish French revolution in the year 1794.
Brunerie did run for the right wing party Movement
National Republican (MNR) in the local elections last year.

He is a member of a lar right wing students fraternity,

GUD, and a sympathizer of the far right wing party

Partie Nationaliste Francais et Europeen (PNFE).

On July 1Sth, Nationalist Brunerie, who is alleged to
have attempted to kill French President Chirac, has been
committed to a psychiatric ward. He has told the system
cops he hated Chirac and wanted to kill him to save
France. The judge declared him to be a danger to the pub-

lic order.

On August 6th, there was system terror in France
against the radical right. The French govemment has
agreed to disband the far right-wing group Radical Unity
and closed the lnternetwebsite too. Stalin likes these guys!

Maxime Brunerie, who tried to shoot French President
Chirac during the Bastille Day Parade in Paris on July
14th, had ties to this group too. Approximately 2,000 peo-
ple were members of this group and was established in the
year 1998. The only legal authority was legislation of the
year 1938 against militias and private armies to disband
the "Radical Unity."

On September 18th, \ M/ll NS collaborator Maurice
Papon was released from a French jailjust hours after a
court ordered that he be freed on health grounds. Papon,

92, was sentenced to 10 years imprisonment in 1998 for
complici$ in crimes against humanity by signing depor-
tation orders which sent French Jews to concentration
camps. The French government will go to an appeal pro-

ceedings.

AUSTRIA: Some days prior to September 21st, the
Federal Ghairman of the FPO (Freedom Party of Austria),
Mrs. Riess-Passer, stepped down after disagreements
about the cause of the FPO policy with Joerg Haider. She
wanted the same party line as the conservative Austrian
People's Pafi (OVP) in the government. The Austrian
people do not need a second kosher OVP. On this
Saturday, there was a special par$ convention to elect
a new FPO federal chairman in the small town of
Obenvart, Austria. Mathias Reichhold was elected with 92



of the 655 present party members. He is the new FPO
chairman and his function in the fusion administration
between FPO and OVP is Minister of Transport. On
November 24th, there will be elections for the National
Assembly of Austria.

SERBIA: On September 29th, there were presidential

elections in Serbia. The leader of the right-wing pafi, the
Serbian Radical Party (SRS), Vojislav Seselj reached the
third place with nearby 23% ot the votes nationwide.

MASSACHUSETTS: The Associated Press, Boston, July
16. The trial of a son of civil rights activists and his girlfriend
began with allegations that they plotted to incite a race war
by blowing up black and Jewish landmarks. Defense attor-
neys said Leo Felton, the son of a white mother and a black
father, and Erica Chase, who is white, were never serious
about carrying out bombings. But prosecutors said in open-
ing statements Monday that the pair hoped to wipe non-
whites from society. Felton, 31, and Chase, 22, have plead-
ed innocent to charges of conspiracy, obstruction of justice,

making counterfeit bills, firearms and explosives violations.
Felton is also charged with bank robbery and conspiracy to
commit bank robbery.

Felton became involved in white supremacist groups while
in a New Jersey prison, where he served time for attempt-
ed murder in the beating of a black taxi driver. Chase began
writing to Felton in prison in April 2000. Chase's attorney,
Timothy Watkins, said she was a pawn for Felton. "Leo
Felton exercised his power over Erica Chase to persuade
her to do the things that he wanted," Watkins said. Assistant
U.S. Attorney Theodore Merritt said the two were part of a
small Aryan cell "c-ommitted to the idea that not all men
were created equal."

To flnance their plans, Merritt said, Felton made counterfeit
money and robbed a bank of $1,100 with a former fellow
inmate, Thomas Struss. Struss is expected to testify that
Felton told him he was making a fertilizer bomb like the one
used in Oklahoma Ci$ to destroy the Holocaust Museum in

Washington. Prosecutors said Struss agreed to testify in

hopes of winning a reduced sentence on a gun possession
charge in a separate case. Felton also kept a list of possi-
ble targets that included the Revs. Jesse Jackson and Al
Sharpton, movie director Steven Spielberg and other well-
known Jewish and black figures, Merritt said.

The case broke in April 2001 after Chase was arrested try-
ing to pass a counterfeit bill at a doughnut shop. Police
found bomb-making material in the couple's apartment
along with newspaper clippings of an upcoming ceremony
at the New England Holocaust Memorial and photos of the
Leonard P. Zakim Bunker Hill Bridge, named after the late
Jewish leader. "The agents discovered a veritable menu of
howto for the terrorist," Merritt said. Chase has told inves-
tigators that they were gathering material to detonate a
bomb on a beach for "entertainment." She said they did not
intend to bomb a target or hurt anyone.

Authorities also found a comic strip-like sketch starring a
white supremacist who bombs African-American housing
projects and Jewish landmarks. Merritt called this "Felton's
script for his tenorist plans." Felton's attorney called them
"just drawings."

Among the first witnesses was Kathy McGaffigan, a close
friend of Chase, who testified about a phone call she got
from Chase after the couple's arrest on the counterfeiting
charge. McGaffigan, a Z?-year-old Harvard University stu-
dent, said Chase asked her to go to the couple's apartment
and remove counterfeit bills, a gun, ammunition, a wiring
and timing device and a SO-pound bag of ammonium
nitrate. McGaffigan said she put most of the items in the
trash, but kept the gun, ammunition and a box of letters at
Chase's request. She also said that when she met Felton
with Chase last year, they told her they were "planning a
bomb."

MARYLAND: Jewish Defense League Activists Scuffle Wth
\flhite Supporters. Two Jewish Radicals Expelled From
County Fair (08/16/02, 10:34:30 PM, LSN Staff). ln
Gaithersburg, two individuals who identified themselves as
members of the radical Jewish Defense League organiza-
tion suffered minor scrapes and bruises today after they
were physically expelled from a campaign literature booth
set up by supporters of lndependent nominee for Maryland
House of Delegates Bill\Mite.

According to witness accounts, the two approached the
booth and began screaming obscenities at booth workers,
calling them "Nazis" and shouting phrases like "Fuck You."
Booth workers asked the two to leave, and they refused,
instead attempting to grab and destroy literature and cam-
paign signs. \Mrite supporter John Latham, who was in

charge of the booth and who works as and armed security
guard and president of a local martial arts academy, then
stepped between the two and the booth, and physically
removed the two angry Jewish individuals, mildly injuring
them in the process.

The two individuals then went to fair otYicials and stated they
were officials of the Anti-Defamation League of B'nai B'rith,
and that they had just been victims of a "hate crime." An
incident then occuned involving the two, who continued to
shriek obscenities at the top of their lungs to fair officials,
fair security, White supporters, and the Montgomery Coun$
Police. Police and fair officials were able to determine after
the incident that the two were not, in fact, officials of the
ADL, and determined that they were known to police as
having a history of provoking similar incidents.

White, who was not present at the scene, spoke to fair offi-
cials that evening, and was told that the incident was con-
sidered "ove/'. White apologized for the confrontation, one
of several minor incidents that have occurred during the
week and that have irked fair officials. The incident repre-
sents the sixth time that White supporters have been
assaulted during this campaign season. ln the most well
known incident, a Wtrite supporter was assaulted by a Van



Hollen for Congress campaign worker, leading local televi-
sion to fill their evening news casts with video of \Mite
throwing the Van Hollen worker into a wall. White and his
supporters have also been assaulted on street comers dur-
ing their recent petition drive, mostly by non-political people
who appeared to be somewhat unstable. \Mite's campaign
spoke to an estimated 15,000 people in order to gather
more than 2,100 signatures for two candidates for the local
state legislative elections.

"The incident that occurred today doesn't particularly both-
er me," \Mrite told the press, "because these incidents
occur all the time. The fact is that for every three or four
thousand people you approach at random on the street, one
is going to assault you. We've pushed out nearly 10,000
pieces of assorted literature at the fair, and odds dictate that
we are going to encounter some people who are going to be
combative. That's why I put John in charge of the booth
when l'm not there - he is the one person besides myself
that I know won't take any crap from people." (Note: That's
right! Kick their butts hard whenever they raise their stinking
heads!)

GEORGIA: On July 20th, about 16 people turned out for a
meeting of the newly forming central Georgia group. The
business part of the meeting was relatively short, as the
main business of the group at the moment was to find and
secure its resources.

John Michael gave a short talk which included a memorable
statement. He said that there is nothing he has which he is
not willing to sacrifice to the movement. And, he said, the
enemy cannot kill him because he is already dead. He died
years ago. lt so happens that John Michael is very talented
with the use of written English, and so he can illuminate his
own meaning of that at whatever time he chooses. However
that statement inspires this tired, old activist to offer up a
few words about the living dead. ln the first place, when you
have anything at all in this life which you care about very
deeply, you eventually discover that it owns you. lt is the
things you love which determine who and what you are. lt is
the things you love, and not your personal welfare or for-
tune, which guide your decisions and initiate your battles.
As an individual you soon realize how small you are.
Secondly, your confidence in the decency and humanity of
your fellow humans dies a slow, hard death. Promote any
view that is not absolutely mainstream and you will have to
endure the slings and arrows of the mob. People will not be
content just to criticize and mock you. They will actively
seek to do you damage. They will try to stir up trouble on
your job and get you fired. They will try to stir up trouble in
your neighborhood and get you run out of your home. They
will try to stir up trouble with the police and get you investi-
gated and harassed and, if at all possible, anested. You will
be accused of everything from child abuse to insanity.
Thirdly, we are allsocialanimals, we humans. We like to be
loved and resptr:ted and all that. But if your views do not set
wellwith the mobs then you may have to live without those
things. ln the racialist movement, the veterans all know they
will be hated by most and loved by few. The people of the

mob not only fail to respect you, they get together in gangs
to throw things at you and try to humiliate you. They some-
times resemble a pack of dogs enjoying the pursuit of a rab-
bit, setting up a big howl and drooling for a taste of the prey.

As you, the rabbit, continually dodge the fury of the pack,
your individual self gets even smaller. Fourthly, we need not
only people who love us but also people that we can love.
This is the part that can bring us to our knees in tears. Our
family and former friends may not be able to withstand the
fury of the pack and may tum from us. New friends may turn
out to be informants or spies. Time after time we face aban-
donment and betrayal. This is the part that delivers the fin-
ishing blow to your egotistical, proud, individual self. And
yet that thing that we love and that owns our lives does not
allow us to choose any other path. By the time we become
hardcore radicals we are indeed dead. Does anyone
remember how the press ranted over the stony faced way
in which Timothy McVeigh received the poison of lron Heel?
But we all know he had already died years before that. All
that was left to him at that point was his physical body, and
that had become a source of misery, imprisoned as it was in
the ugly steel box of the oppressors in solitary confinement.

But at the point where one is dead, one becomes
Superman. From that day forward there is no limit to the
things one can accomplish. From that day forward, you will
amaze even yourself. ln a sense, there is no life until after
death. That was the lesson of Odin as he hung on the tree.
It was also the lesson of Jesus as he hung on the cross.
And he was human enough to feel all of the pain. Most
Christians value their religion because of the promise of life
after death. But Jesus followed his path even though he
knew how it would end. And look at the life he had BEFORE
he died. \lUhen you have found something for which you are
willing to give up your life, that is when you can truly live.

But, back to the meeting. When the business was over,
there was good music, good conversation and plenty to eat.
Bags of rolled literature, "ready-to-throw", were provided for
the departing guests. The central Georgia group is full of
youth and enthusiasm. Stay tuned! (Article provided by
Auntie Racist)

INDIANA : On August 2, 3 and 4 of 2002, White Pride Fest
was hosted in Osceola, lndiana, by the National Knights. I

camped on the grounds along with a number of others.
Most of the musicians let us down for one reason or anoth-
er, but the Johnny Tat Band showed up like real troupers.
OHS handled the securi$ and they counted 154 people into
the gates. The lmperial Klans of America provided security
for the special dinner for the leaders that was held after-
ward. The speeches were radical.

Terrible Tommy Metzger was, of course, Terrible and made
several memorable statements. "l'm not a right winge/', he
said, "the right wing has failed. I'll pick from the left and from
the right, whatever I want." He said some of the so-called
left wingers are more clued in to what's going on than the
racists are. He also said Aryans should not waste any effort
fighting communists, ARAs or blacks. (Actually he said "nig-



gers", but Auntie Racist tries to be polite.) None of those campus
people have the power or money to successfully oppress
white people, he said. He laughed off the idea that he
directs a dangerous group of followers. "l don't have mem-
bers", he said, "l just have quiet people out there in the
shadows who know what they need to do and they don't
need my instruction."

Matt Hale spoke next and I was sitting there taking notes,
expecting to jot down a few notes from each one of the
speeches, when Reverend Loy approached and asked if I

would speak. I was somewhat astonished, as I have been a
writer for years but I am not a speaker. So I missed out on
the other speeches as I hurriedly tried to compose one of
my own. So the only other speech I can quote is mine.

I tried to point out that our view of the nature of life and sur-
vival constitutes a fundamental difference between the
racialists and the "|eft" radicals (except that, not being a
very good speaker, I didn't say it that well). To us, as soon
as we are born our survival is a matter of aggressive action.
lf you survive, it's because you survive. A verb in present

active. Life is not static. You act or you perish. Even an
infant is required to cry when it is hungry or it won't get fed.
That is the meaning of the life rune.

The left wing seem to believe that survival is the natural and
moral state of existence and that if anything interferes, it
has to be a breach of justice somehow They seem to
believe that the only reason the entire human race can't sur-
vive on some kind of moral inertia alone is because some
evilforce has corrupted nature.

Although I didn't get to hear them all, the line-up of speak-
ers was impressive: Tom Metzger/WAR, Matt
HaIeMCOTC, Ted Dunn/SS Action Group, Mike
Schuler/NSM, Bill Blankenship/Blood and Honour, Harold
Bertram/Nationalist Times, Ron Edwards/lKA, Rev. Richard
Loy/Church of National Knights, Rev. Ray Larsen/Church of
National Knights. There were participants from all over the
country. lncluded among the guests was a photographer
who was recording the event for Rolling Stone magazine.

This is the first major event in this area since Pastor Miles
died back in '92. The National Knights hope to make this an
annual event. They did a great job on the first one, so we
all have something to look foruvard to. (Article provided by
Auntie Racist)

IDAHO: July 8, 20O2*Congratulations to everyonel With all
your help, we did it. We sent the so-called Kootenai County
Task Force on Human Relations packing their bags for
another location.

This organization will not be allowed to promote their agen-
da of "homosexuality" and "diversity" from the North ldaho
College campus any longer"! Our sources have confirmed
that hundreds of phone calls and e-mails were sent to ldaho
elected officials and to North ldaho College Administration,
demanding the removal of this task force from the college

How dare this task force use our college to promote its
agenda of "homosexuality" and "diversity" upon our com-
munity and our impressionable young children. Did you
know that "diversity" actually promotes sex between ani-
mals and humans? lt also includes sex with children. The
message of "homosexuality" and "diversity" will not stop
with this group moving to another location in the Coeur
d'Alene area. We must call Govemor Kempthorne and all
our elected officials to tell them it's time to put a stop to this
attack upon our children's minds and bodies by this task
force.

This task force must be shut down immediately before
another child is hurt! Remember two leading members of
this task force have been convicted and jailed for the homo-
sexual raping of two young minor boys in Kootenai County,
ldaho. One of the leading members raped his own young
grandson. This task force actually "does not have any state
or county authority." lt is a private organization that pro-
motes its own agenda of "homosexuality" and "diversity".

Thank you again for your help in removing this organization
from the North ldaho College Campus. Now we must shut
them down permanently! (Article provided by James Booth
of Coeur d'Alene, ldaho)

WASHINGTON: On July 6, 2002, near Yelm, Washington,
approximately 55 skinheads and other White Nationalists
attended a fund-raiser concert for an Hammerskin of an
EHS (Eastern Hammerskins) chapter who is currently fac-
ing federal racially motivated assault charges. Entry fee was
$20 and another $20 was asked for all-you-can-drink keg
beer. Four kegs of beer were consumed and some atten-
dees brought their own beverages.

The first Oi band to perform was Portland's Jew Slaughter
which played such favorites as "Jew SlaughteC', "Nigger Kill
88", "Youth of Hitlef' and "Sharp Shooter." As the slam
dance began, one of the dancers accidentally kicked or
slammecj into a dog which wanted to dance too supposed-
ly. The dog snapped at the dancer's T-shirt. Then the dog
went after an overweight (by life insurance company stan-
dards) skinhead, almost taking a bite out of his spare tire. ln
no time, the skinhead put on a T-shirt and kept it on for the
rest of the event.

Final \Afar from Orange County, California, was the next
band to perform which played such songs as "Hail the New
Dawn" and "Nigger, I'm Going to F-k You Up."

The third band was Portland's lntimidation One which per-
formed such songs as "Sturmfuehrer", "O'Leary
Remembered" and "Oi, Oi, Portland."

The fourth band to perform was Max Resist from Detroit
(Ml)which performed such numbers as "RJM" (for Robert J.

Mathews), "RAHOWA" and "88."



Finally after some of the crowd had dispersed, the singer of
the famous German band "Radikahl" backed by members
of lntimidation One and Max Resist sang four German
favorites such as "Swastika", "Resistance" and "Brawlers of
the Night'. (These are all translated titles of course.)

Radikahl is currently here in the United States recording a
split CD with lntimidation One, and playing one more gig in
Denver, Colorado, on the weekend of July 11th.The band
was flown to record here because of our good freedom of
speech laws that, unlike the laws of their land, allow the
right to speak freely within the music's text.

During a break between band performances, an efiigy of a
Negro was brought from behind the house so three small
children could learn racial patriotism. As the effigy was held
in the air, dangling from a long stick, the children took turns
swinging a stick at it as though the effigy were a Mexican
pinata. Everybody thought that was pretty funny. After the
effigy was nearly demolished, some others at the gathering

kicked what was left of the effigy until it was almost beyond
recognition.

There were no real problems at the event. lt was reported
that some law enforcement vehicles were outside the pri-
vate property so an announcement was made, now and
then, that anybody who was drinking under age needed to
stop. Also, because of the Hammerskin Nation's "No Drug
Policy" among it's members, another announcement was
made that anyone who was caught using drugs on the
premises, would be beaten down.

A person who looked like a Negro was asked to leave
because of his dark skin although his hair texture was that
of a \Mrite person. The trigger incident for this is not clear
although some people felt uncomfortable with this guy's
presence. As security personnel lead the darkie away, it

was announced by the current band leader that "Sammy
Davis, Juniof' was being escorted off the propefi.

Another person escorted off the propefi by security was a
young skinhead who was not necessarily a bad person but
he had engaged in irresponsible drinking and the alcohol
got the best of him. Exactly what the problem was with this
fellow is not known to this writer but it must be fairly stated
that there were plenty of drunks who were just that and did
not cause problems.

All$1,100 dollars in expenses were recovered plus a profit
of $300 that will be donated to the member of EHS who is
being charged with the charges stated in the beginning of
this article. The event started at about 3 o'clock and seemed
to have ended at midnight.

BUSINESS

The following is from an imprisoned paralegalwho has had
good results, allowing prisoners to receive literature.He
writes, "l have received the two N.S.V. Reports that you
mailed together. Those were OCT/DEC 2000 and JAN/MAR

2001. As far as other prisoners not receiving their reports,
the quotes and case law received from 'Stormwatch' when
it was still putting out their publication says, 'Material of a
radical or revolutionary political nature may not be censored
solely because of the beliefu expressed .... Similarly, racial
and religious literature may be censored only if it actually
incites or encourages violence; mere statements express-
ing or supporting racial antagonism cannot be suppressed.'

United States ex rel. Larkins Vs Oswald, 510 F. 2d 583,
587-588 (2d Cir. 1975); Aikens Vs Jenkins, 534 F. 2d 192,
751, 753 (7th Cir. 1976); Jackson Vs Godwin, 400 F. 2d
529, 535 (Sth Cir. 1968); Long Vs Parker, 390 F. 2d 816,822
(3rd Cir. 1968); Jackson Vs Ward, 458 F. Supp. 546, 558,
562 (W.D.N.Y. 1e78).

These are all Federal Case Law that I have used in the past,

so I'm sure you'll find them useful. Well, l'm going to go

ahead and close this for now. I look fonrard to hearing back
from you and the outcome of the appeals to the prisons.
Thank You and take care! 141881 Jason Judd, Corcoran,
CA.

IN MEMORIAM

FRANK DESALES BIRDSALL (27 JUL 36 - 29 JUL 02) died
of a massive heart attack.

His first involvement in our Movement was during 1963
when he would drive 60 miles every Saturday to attend our
National Socialist street rallies in the Yorkville section of
Manhattan. As the owner of the largest funce building busi-
ness in Orange & Rockland Counties, he was also a major
donor of finances to the American Nazi Par$. ln 1988, he
sacrificed his business when he held a Klan/National
Socialist picnic upon his property and the publicity of that, in
the Jew controlled media, caused him not only to lose his
business but to be dismissed from the City Council, where
he was constantly challenging every Liberal member on
every issue.

Adhering to his wishes, Mr. Frank Birdsall has been cre-
mated and his ashes spread in the Hudson River. Let us all
say a warm Farewell to this hero of a man, one who will not
be forgotten by his friends and family! Frank was a very
close personal friend of mine and I shall miss him dearly!
(This information was provided by NSM Comrade Bill Hoff.)

Frank's daughter, Kimberly, provided us with the following
additional information. Frank had one sister, Grace Seaver,
and five children-Frank Birdsall, Jr; Mark Birdsall; Eric
Birdsall; Charlene Meyers; Kimberly Birdsall. He was the
owner of Birdsall Fence Company, N.;wburgh, New York.
He was married to Martha Birdsallfor 36 years.

My father did not want an obituary in the local paper in New
York,,,,he said he did not want his enemies having a cele-
bration (smile). That's my dad for ya. I remember Charlie
Holland from when I was a child. I also know Bill Hoff-he
was very nice to me when I was young

L



WLLIAM PIERCE (11 SEP 33 - 23 JUL 02), one of
America's most famous and influential pro-White activist,
writer and organizer, died at about 12:00 noon of cancer at
his mountaintop home in Mill Point, (VW).

Author of the famous incendiary novel of America's future,
"The Turner Diaries', Pierce also wrote the novel "Hunter."
Both were written under the pen name Andrew Macdonald,
a nod to his Scottish heritage. By itself, "The Tumer Diaries"
probably recruited more people to the cause of Write racial-
ism than any other publication, person, organization or
event (with exception of Black riots).

Pierce was born in Atlanta, Georgia. His early years were
spent mainly in the South, especially Texas, where he
attended a military school for a short time. His first love from
his early years was science. He was experimenting with
chemistry and other sciences in his parents' garage and
basement when he was just a boy. He continued his own
experiments in his private workshop almost until his death.

Pierce went on to be awarded a masters and a doctorate in
physics from the University of Colorado after eaming an
undergraduate degree at Rice Universig and briefly taking
graduate classes at Cal Tech. Pierce later described his
almost total immersion in his experiments for his degrees.
He spent days in the laboratories, sleeping next to the table
where he was working. Pierce then taught physics at
Oregon State University from 1962-1966, where he attained
tenure in less than three years, about twice as fast as usual.

During his time at Oregon State, Pierce began becoming
racially and politically aware after previously being almost
totally unaware of politics and current events. Briefly he
joined the John Birch Society. As his politics quickly became
more radical he stopped teaching and began reading heav-
ily about politics, European History, race differences and
other related matters. He considered writing his own book
about what he had discovered, then found to his amaze-
ment that such books had been written years before with no
lasting effect on the public or elite. This caused him to begin
searching for another way to stop the destruction of the
Write race.

About this time, in late 1966, Pierce wrote a long letter to a
man he felt was doing the most to advance the cause of
White Americans to American Nazi Party leader George
Lincoln Rockwell. Rockwell's long gracious letter in retum
had a life-long effect on Pierce, and not only for its political
content. Pierce made a habit of personally answering many
of the letters sent to him for the rest of his life, convinced
that many people could be brought to the cause of \Mite
Nationalism with such personal attention to their inquires.

Pierce moved to \A/bshington, D.C., that same year and,
while never officially joining the ANP, he worked closety with
Rockwell on many projects such as editing and writing for
the Party publication the National Socialist World. Pierce
also worked in the print shop for the ANP and quite quickly
gained knowledge of the printing business that would be of

great use in the future. lt was at the print shop that he first
met another Rockwell associate, a man whom he instantly
disliked and who eventually was kicked out of the ANP, and
returned to assassinate Rockwell,

Most important of all, Pierce spent many hours in Rockwell's
personal office watching and listening to Roclorvell handle
the running of his organization. This experience would also
prove very valuable for the future.

After Rockwell's assassination on August 25, 1967, Pierce
became one of the leaders of the new National Socialist
\Mite People's Pafi, the successor group to the ANP. ln
1970 he was expelled from the NSVIIPP and joined the
National Youth Alliance, which had metamorphosed out of
the Youth for Wallace campaign organization started by
\flillis Carto. Several other ANP members also joined.
Ongoing problems with Carto led the NYA to split into fac-
tions. By 1974 Pierce led the new faction now called the
National Alliance, headquartered in Vlhshington (DC). This
organization and its ideology e,ontinue almost unchanged as
today's National Alliance.

ln the early years of the NA Pierce attempted to answer the
spiritual questions and yearnings of members by starting
the Cosmotheist Church, a religion sharing the philosophy
of the NA and stressing the unity of man with nature, and
the value and spiritual and biological continuity of the White
Race. Contrary to many criticisms of the Cosmotheist
Church by the mainstream press and Jewish militant organ-
izations as merely a tax-dodge, Pierce and his followers
were very serious about the new religion and its philosophy;
in fact for a time separate meetings were held by regular NA
members and by those more interested in Cosmotheism.

The NationalAlliance quickly began publishing a magazine
for sale to the general public called 'Attackl" After it was
clear that the street-fighting and other disruptions of the
1960s were ove( Pierce declared a change of tactics, but
not strategy, and renamed the magazine "National
Vanguard." NV was a more sophisticated magazine,
designed to appeal to the professionals and others that
Pierce felt were needed to build a revolutionary organiza-
tion. lt was in "Attack!" and the early "National Vanguard'
that Pierce laid down the ideological basis for the Alliance;
an ideology that has stood the test of time and had much to
do with the Alliance's subsequent long-term success. The
pertinent articles are available from National Vanguard
Books in The Best of Attack! and "National Vanguard."

ln 1985, Pierce moved the Alliance from h/bshington (DC)
to a 400-acre parcel of land in Mill Point, West Virginia, near
Hillsboro. ln one of the most isolated, mountiainous and
unpopulated regions east of the Mississippithe Alliance was
free to grow without the interference of the local, state or
federal governments. This move showed great foresight on
the part of Pierce. \Mrere almost every other pro-White
organization has suffered some type of attack by govern-
ments and lawyers the Alliance has been relatively ftee of
such hindrances.



Pierce and the NA began a large number of ambitious proj-
ects designed to spread their message, attract new mem-
bers and raise money to fund their work. Most projects were
an ingenious combination of outreach and fundraising.
National Vanguard Books, lnc. was started while still in DC
to sell a wide variety of books important to White activists
and scholars. ln West Virginia, NVB grew very quickly with
hundreds of titles, a yearly catalog and ever-increasing
sales that required the building of a new warehouse.

Pierce also began a weekly broadcast called American
Dissident Voices. At first a number of people, most notably
Kevin Strom, wrote and broadcast the half-hour addresses
but eventually the task fell solely to Pierce. The Alliance
arranged contracts with a large number of AM and FM sta-
tions and also broadcast on Short-Wave radio. Howevei
the ADV address is now mainly a product of the lnternet and
tens of thousands of people each week either read or listen
to it on the lntemet or receive it in the mail as the publica-
tion'Free Speech."

Membership in the Alliance grew rapidly in the 1990s. There
are currently members in every state and in every part of the
world where \IUhites live. The growth led to the creation of
local units that could engage in Alliance activity as a group.
Some regional coordinators were also appointed but gener-
ally Pierce felt that level of organization was not yet neces-
34ry.

Pierce began holding twice-yearly leadership conferences
to find new leaders and spur growth and activities. The
Alliance became known for its professionel approach to
White activism, for energetic recruiting and innovative ways
of spreading the Alliance message.

ln 1999 Pierce and the Alliance purchased the assets of
Resistance Records, a \Mrite Power music producer and
distributor, Soon after Pierce also oversaw the purchase of
the assets of Nordland Records, further increasing the size
of the new Resistance Records, LLC. Wth the recent sales
of the video game Ethnic Cleansing, Resistance has cap-
tured the market for disaffected White youths and earned
significant money and new recruits for the Alliance.

The Alliance, National Vanguard Books and Resistance
Records gained an early and vitally important lnternet pres-
ence. While Pierce himself never became lnternet sawy
(Eye problems severely hampered his use of computer
screens.), or knew much about youth-market \Mite Power
music, he ably delegated these tiasks to staff members and
off-site Alliance members to keep the Alliance up to date
technologically.

Pierce also during this time solidified ties with other large
pro-White groups in Europe, most notably the British
National Party and the NPD in Germany.

Pierce's strong leadership style and strict enforcement of
rules helped the Alliance grow without the internal strife that
eventually tears apart almost every other pro-\Mite organi-

zation. His leadership abilities, communication abilities,
vision, unending personal commitment and intelligence
were the primary source of the group's abili$, strength and
influence.

Pierce had always attracted national media attention and
did interviews with media outlets in America and around the
world. One year ago a very even-handed book about Pierce
was written by Professor Robert S. Griffin called The Fame
of a Dead Man's Deeds: An Up-Close Portrait of White
Nationalist William Pierce. The most informative and
exhaustive book or article ever written about Pierce. The
cost is $23.95 and can be ordered from NationalVanguard
Books, P.O. Box 330, Rt. 39, Hillsboro, \ /V 24946.

ln Griffin's book, Pierce is quoted as saying that he feared
something in his past would catch up with him or something
to that effect if he remained in the Washington, DC, area but
he never gave any details.. lt is this writer's belief that
Pierce was part of a conspiracy to assassinate Rockwell.
Rockwell and Pierce worked well together but Rockwell's
way of doing things were not like Pierce's way. They had
disagreements. Pierce wanted to head the NS\A/PP but
Rockwellwas in the way. Matt Koehl also wanted to run the
NSWPP but Rockwell was in the way. At first, Pierce and
Koehl got along but their differences eventually came to the
fore. John Patler (At(A Patsalos) was eventually convicted
of Rockwell's assassination but former ANP member Frank
Smith is positive that Robert Lloyd was the killer. The queer
Matt Koehl was having small talk with Doug Niles' wife as an
alibi. Koehl dislikes small talk with women. Dr. Pierce pro-
vided the alibi for Robert Lloyd. For the remainder of
Pierce's life, he kept in friendly contact with Koehl despite
the fact that the two despised each other. For related infor-
mation about Pierce, Koehl and Rockwell, see "NSV

Report" issues for OCT/DEC 1993, JUUSEP 1995 and
Pierce's final evaluation of the NS\ /PP under Matt Koehl.

ln the few months before his diagnosis Pierce and others
noticed he was somewhat thinner and more drawn than
usual. Pierce had also mentioned feeling far more tired than
he had in the past. But his mind was as sharp as ever and
with the Alliance busier than ever Pierce continued with his
usual workload -- 12-14 hours a day,7 days a week -. at his
office in the Alliance headquarters complex.

Pierce never had much faith or trust in medical doctors and,
until the cancer diagnosis, had almost always been in excel-
lent health. Pierce's mother had lived into her eighties and
most of those who knew Pierce expected him to be leading
the Alliance for at least that long. His death therefore came
as a shock to all concerned.

HAIL VICTORY!
The Directors

National Socialist Vanguard


